CITY OF LOVES PARK

ORDINANCE NO: 3598-09

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS 18-26
AND 18-27 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF
THE CITY OF LOVES PARK, ILLINOIS, ADOPTING THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, EDITION 2006,
AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

ADOPTED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF LOVES PARK, ILLINOIS,
THIS 21°T DAY OF DECEMBER, 2009

Published in Pamphlet Form by

Authority of the Mayor and City Council
Of the City of Loves Park, Illinois, this 28"
Day of December, 2009

JQMQ._MW
Robert J. Burden, City Clerk

5&(§‘¢L\ﬂ0 K. HJUQ




ORDINANCE NO. 3598-09

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS 18-26 and 18-27
OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF LOVES PARK

WHEREAS, Section 18-26 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Loves Park regulates design,
construction, alteration, enlargement, repair, demolition, removal, maintenance and
use of all buildings and structures located within the City; and

WHEREAS, the City of Loves Park desires to ensure public safety in such buildings and structures; and
WHEREAS, the City desires to amend said section.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LOVES PARK,
WINNEBAGO COUNTY, ILLINOIS AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION ONE: Section 18-26 of the Loves Park City Code is hereby rescinded and replaced to
read as follows:

The International Building Code, 2006 edition, including Appendix Chapters A, B, F, G, H, and I, as
published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the City
of Loves Park, in the State of Illinois for regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all
property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other
physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation
and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the
demolition of such structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection fees
therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Building
Code are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes prescribed in Section Two of this ordinance.

SECTION TWO: Section 18-27 is rescinded and replaced as follows:
Section 18-27 Amendments to the Building Code.
The International Building Code, 2006 edition, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 is amended as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Loves Park, State of
Illinois, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

Section 101.4.4 is amended as follows:

101.4.4 Plumbing. The provisions of the International Plumbing Code and the State of Illinois
Plumbing Code (each as adopted), shall govern erection, installation, alteration, repair and replacement




of plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings, appurtenances, where
connected to a water or sewage system, and all aspects of a medical gas system. Where there is a
reference to the “International Plumbing Code”, it shall mean “the International Plumbing Code AND
the State of Illinois Plumbing Code”. Where there is a discrepancy between the two codes, the most
restrictive code shall apply unless the less restrictive code is approved by the code official.

Section 104.1.1 is added as follows:

104.1.1 Fire Official approval. The Fire Official for the City of Loves Park shall have the authority
to issue orders based on requirements of this code for matters pertaining to design, materials or
equipment when related to fire protection.

Section 105.2 is amended as follows:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and
Similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet (11 m?), and is not
supported by another structure.
through 5. remain unchanged,

Sidewalks, patios, and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade,
and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.
7. through 10. remain unchanged.
11. Swings and other playground equipment.
12. through 13 remain unchanged.
14. Replacement of doors and windows provided the size is not changed and a fire rating is not
required.
15. Repair or replacement of interior wall and ceiling coverings provided:
a. not more than 50% of coverings in a room are removed,
b. coverings are not part of a fire rated assembly,
c. structural elements in a hazardous condition are not exposed.

SAN

Section 105.7 is deleted and replaced as follows:

105.7 Posting Permit. The permit holder shall post the permit on the job site in a conspicuous place at all
times, visible from the street, until the final inspection has been made and approved. The building official
is authorized to impose a reinspection fee when the permit is not posted.

Section 106.3 is amended as follows:

106.3 Examination of documents. The building official shall examine or cause to be examined the
accompanying construction documents and shall ascertain by such examinations whether the construction
indicated and described is in accordance with the requirements of this code and other pertinent laws or
ordinances. The Fire Department shall review all plans for issuance of building, fire suppression and fire
alarm (electrical) permits, other than one and two family dwelling projects. The plans will be made
available in the Building Department offices. If the plans do not conform to the requirements set forth by
this code, they shall be rejected by the Fire Department pursuant to Section 106 of this code.



Section 108.4 is deleted and replaced as follows:

108.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. When a permit is required by this code, and work is
started or proceeded with, prior to obtaining said permit, the fees established in Section 108.2 shall be
doubled and not less than $250.00. This penalty may be waived by the building official if the person in
violation has not obtained a permit in the last year and is the owner of the property. For the second offense
within a twelve (12) month period, starting or proceeding with the work prior to obtaining a permit, the
fees established in Section 108.2 shall be doubled and not less than $500.00 plus an additional fee of
$500.00 shall be paid for each day work continued without said permit. For the third such instance within
a twelve (12) month period, the fees established in Section 108.2 shall be tripled and not less than $750.00
plus an additional fee of $750.00 shall be paid for each day work continued without said permit. For the
fourth such instance within a twelve (12) month period, the offender shall be prosecuted by the

City of Loves Park Legal Department as permitted by state law. The payment of such fees shall not
relieve any person from complying with the requirement of this code and the execution of the work,

nor from any penalties prescribed herein.

Section 108.7 is added as follows:

108.7 Governmental exceptions: Permits are required for all governmental projects in accordance with
Sections 106, 107 and 108 of this code. No permit fees or inspection charges shall be charged for
construction projects directly contracted by the City of Loves Park, State of Illinois, Winnebago County,

or the United States of America. All other units of government shall pay $30.00 for each permit. Examples
of these governmental units include the Rockford Park District, Rockford Mass Transit District, Rock River
Water Reclamation District, North Park Water District, Winnebago County Forest Preserve District, North
Suburban Library System, Rockford Township, Harlem Township and other similar governmental units.

Section 108.8 is added as follows:

108.8 Reinspection and testing. Where any work or installation does not pass an initial test or
inspection, the necessary correction shall be made so as to achieve compliance with this code. The
contractor shall then request that the work or installation be reinspected or retested. The permit holder
will be subject to a reinspection fee according to Section 18-28 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of
Loves Park, for the first, and each additional, reinspection or test performed.

Section 110.5 is added as follows:
110.5 New buildings. Before a certificate of occupancy is issued for new buildings, other than one-and
two-family dwellings, the Fire Department may inspect the building in accordance with Section 109.3 and
notify the Building Department of the results of their inspection.
Section 115.4 is deleted and replaced as follows:
115.4 Method of service. Such notice shall be deemed to be properly serves if a copy thereof is:

1. Delivered to the owner personally; or

2. Sent by first class mail, postage prepaid, to the owner at the last known address; or

3. Sent by certified mail, postage prepaid addressed to the owner at the last known address with
return receipt requested, if required by state law.



Section 202 is amended as follows:

Section 202 Definitions

STRUCTURE. That which is built or constructed or portion thereof. This shall include all buildings,
but shall not include any other structures that are in a public right-of-way.

Section 303.1 is amended as follows:

303.1 Assembly Group A. Assembly Group A occupancy includes, among others, the use of a building
or structure, or a portion thereof, for the gathering together of persons for purposes such as civic, social or
religious functions, recreations, food or drink consumption, or awaiting transportation. A room or space
used for assembly purposes by less than 50 persons and 750 square feet or less shall be included as a part
of that occupancy. Assembly occupancies shall include the following:
(The remainder of this section remains unchanged.)

Section 313 is added as follows:

SECTION 313
PERSONAL CARE FACILITIES

313.1 General. The following table is hereby established and shall be used to be used to clarify how to
distinguish occupancies listed in Sections 305.2, 308.2, 308.3.1, 308.5.1, 308.5.2, and 310.1 and to
summarize requirements of Sections 903 and 907.

Occupancy ————»

E Educational

11 Institutional

12 |nstitutional

i4 institutiona!

R4 Residential

R3 Residential

Board care, Child Care Adult or Child Day Care Residential Residentiai Carg/ .
assisted living, Facility that is not an accessory to] Care/ Assisted §.. ~ Assisted Living
Day Care o_o_nvalescent a place of wprshm_—A_S- Living T
% * if ali child care rooms facilites half-way useq ony during rel|g|ousr
@ located at level of exit house, group functions. ** More than 5
5 discharge and each has home, congrggate adulits capable of self
g an exit door directly to care, social preservation are classified
& exterior  If not classified rehabilitation, Group A3
as Group I-4 alcohol & drug
‘ centers, etc
Hours of care per day <24 24 24 <24 any amount 24
Number of care
recipients 6 to 100* </=5 >/=17 >[=6 >f=6"" 6 - 16 PR
Age of care recipients or or less or ¥
in years 2 12 less] > 2 1/2 NA 2 12 >2 112 2 112 less NA Yes
Care recipients X
capable of responding L
in an emergency No* Yes Yes No Yes** No Yes Yes .
>20,000 sf FA except ; =5
when all classrooms =
Sprinkler required widoor to grade Always Always >16 care recipients No No _{‘_;’
Manual Fire Alarm 18
required >50 occupants Always Always >16 care recipients No No : E "
Automatic Fire No, unless per IBC o . % g
Detection required 907 2 3 Always Always >16 care reciplents No No &
Not required o 15
Single-Multiple Station where automatic . £
Smoke Alarms No, unless per {BC fire detection No, unless per Always and Always and,. g?
required 907 2 3 provided IBC 907 2.3 JAlways and interconnected] interconnected interconnected: § .




Section 402.4.6 is amended as follows:

402.4.6 Service area fronting on exit passageways. Mechanical rooms, electrical rooms, building service
areas and service elevators are permitted to open directly into exit passageways provided that the passage-
way has walls, floors, and ceilings of not less than 1-hour fire-resistance rating and not less that required
for any connecting exit enclosure. Exit passageways shall be constructed as fire barriers in accordance
with Section 706, and opening protectives shall be in conformance with the requirements of Section 714.

Section 403.1 is amended as follows:

403.1 Applicability: The provisions of this section shall apply to buildings with an occupied floor located
more than 65 feet (19812 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

Section 403.10.3 is added as follows:

403.10.3 Emergency systems. Exit signs, exit illumination as required by Chapter 10 and Section 2702 of
this code, and elevator car lighting are classified as emergency systems and shall operate within 10 seconds
after the failure of the normal power supply, and shall be capable of being transferred to the standby source.

Section 404.1.1 is amended as follows:

404.1.1 Definition. The following word and term shall, for the purposes of this chapter and as used
elsewhere in this code, have the meaning shown herein.

ATRIUM. An opening connecting two or more floor levels other than enclosed stairways, elevators,
hoistways, escalators, plumbing, electrical, air-conditioning or other equipment, which is closed at the top
and not defined as a mall. Floor levels, as used in this definition, do not include balconies within assembly
groups or mezzanines that comply with Section 505.

Section 404.4 Exception is amended as follows:

404.4 Smoke Control. Exception: Smoke control is not required for atriums that connect only two
floor levels.

Section 412.5.7 is added as follows:

412.5.7 Standpipe systems. Standpipe systems shall be installed and maintained in accordance with the
International Fire Code and NFPA 14 as listed in Chapter 35.

Section 421 is added as follows:

SECTION 421
FACTORY-BUILT STRUCTURES

421.1 General. All factory-built structures shall comply with the current issue of the Illinois Department
of Public Health Regulation of Factory-Built Structures. Permit applicants shall submit complete
construction documents OR submit a certificate from the manufacturer that indicates a design

professional has certified that the unit complies with federal codes and another nationally recognized code.
If the structure is smaller in size than that requiring a design professional’s certification by federal and



7

state laws, the manufacturer may submit a certification for their closet size unit (which requires certification)
and a cover letter which states the smaller unit is of substantially equivalent construction.

Section 503.1.4 is added as follows:

503.1.4 A-5 Occupancies. A-5 occupancies height and area limitations are limited to the requirements
of Group A-4 as set forth in Table 503.

Section 507.1 is amended as follows:

507.1 General. The area of buildings of the occupancies and configurations specified herein shall not be
limited. Unlimited area buildings shall not be of type V construction or contain a basement.

Section 507.5 is amended as follows:

507.5 Reduced open space. The permanent open space of 60 feet (18288 mm) required in Sections
507.2, 507.3, 507.4, 507.6, and 507.10 shall be permitted to be reduced to not less than 30 feet
(9144 mm) for one-story buildings and 40 feet (12192 mm) for two-story buildings provided the
following requirements are met:

1. The reduced open space shall not be allowed for more than 75 percent of the perimeter of the
building.
2. The exterior wall facing the reduced open space shall have a minimum fire-resistance rating of 3
hours.
4. Openings in the exterior wall facing the reduced open space shall have opening protectives with
a minimum fire protection rating of 3 hours.
Section 603.1 Number 22 is amended as follows:

603.1 Allowable materials. 22. Materials exposed within plenums complying with Section 602 of the
International Mechanical Code, the State of Illinois Plumbing Code, and the Electrical Code.

Section 702.1 shall be amended as follows:

702.1 Definitions.

FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE. The distance measured from the building face to one of the following:
1. The closest interior lot line;
2. To the centerline of a street, an alley, or public way, or
3. To an imaginary line between two buildings on the property.

This distance shall be measured at right angles from the plane of the building wall face.

Section 704.8 is amended by adding the following exception:

704.8 Allowable area of openings:

Exception: Existing buildings complying with Section 3402.5.



Section 711.4 shall be amended as follows:

711.4 Continuity. Assemblies shall be continuous without openings, penetrations or joints except as
permitted by this section and Sections 707.2, 712.4, 713 and 1020.1. Skylights and other penetrations
through a fire-resistance rated roof deck are permitted to be unprotected, provided that the structural
integrity of the fire-resistance-rated roof construction is maintained. Unprotected skylights shall not be
permitted in roof construction required to be fire-resistance rated in accordance with Section 704.10.
The supporting construction shall be protected to afford the required fire-resistance rating of the
horizontal assembly supported except for 1-hour fire-resistance-rated incidental use area separations
as required by Table 508.2 in buildings of Type IIB, IIIB, and VB construction.

Section 903.2.3 is amended as follows:

903.2.3. Group B and F. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings
containing Groups B and F occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:
1. Where a Group B or F fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m?) or
2. Where a Group B or F fire area is located more that two stories above grade; or
5. Where the combined area of all Group B or F fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m?).

Section 903.2.5 Exception is deleted and replaced as follows:
903.2.5 Group L.

Exceptions: An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.2 or
Section 903.3.1.3 shall be allowed in:

1. Group I-1 facilities.
2. Occupancy I-4 with not more than sixteen occupants, excluding staff.

Section 903.2.6 is amended as follows:

903.2.6 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings containing a
Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. Where a Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m?), or
1. Where a Group M fire area is located more than two stories above grade; or
2. Where the combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 24,000 square feet, (2230 m?)

Section 903.2.7.1 is added as follows:

903.2.7.1 Group R-1. An automatic fire sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1
shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R-1 fire area.

Exceptions:
1. Where guestrooms are not more than two stories above the lowest level or exit discharge
and each guestroom has at least one door leading directly to an exterior exit access that
leads directly to approved exits.



